USS Research [MAHE]

From: Nagendra Chandrashekar [MAHE-USS]

Sent: 15 September 2023 06:00 PM

To: Akhila Satyamurthy - 201100119

Cc: Sunanda S. Nayak [MAHE-USS]; Suresh Nayak [MAHE-KMC]; Dinesh Naik [MAHE-USS];
Pramod Kamath [MAHE-USS]; USS Research [MAHE]

Subject: NEFT:Rs.93,541.00

Attachments: To manipal 3rd installment RG.PDF

Dear Madam,

With reference to trailing Email, We wish to bring to your kind notice that Rs.93,541.00 has been credited by

HEART FAILURE ASSOCIAT to the bank account of Manipal Academy of Higher Education, Manipal through

NEFT.

CTY6193838 TRANSFER
BY TRANSFER-INB Payment = FROM
T y/025 towards Invoice/Bill-- 34007104647 HEART Dol
FAILURE ASSOCIAT /
Regards
Nagendra

Grants Office,

Advanced Research Centre

Manipal Academy of Higher Education
Phone :0820 2937729

Please Do Not Print This Email, Unless It Is Absolutely Necessary Save Papers, Save Trees.

From: akhila satyamurthy <asmeenaakhila@gmail.com>

Sent: 13 September 2023 10:47 AM

To: Nagendra Chandrashekar [MAHE-USS] <nagendra.c@manipal.edu>; Sunanda S. Nayak [MAHE-USS]
<sunanda.nayak@manipal.edu>; USS Research [MAHE] <uss.research@manipal.edu>

Cc: Jeemon Panniyammakal <jeemon@sctimst.ac.in>; abrahambabu@gmail.com; Dr. Padmakumar
<padmakumar69@yahoo.co.in>; Physiotherapy [MAHE-MCHP] <physio.coahs@manipal.edu>; Akhila Satyamurthy -
201100119 <akhila.satyamurthyl@learner.manipal.edu>

Subject: Fwd: Release of grant amount- for the third six months

Dear All,

Greetings. This is to inform you all that the grant amount for the third 6 months has been released by HFAL
Kindly verify the same.

Please find the below trail of mail for your kind perusal.
1



Thanking you.

Kind Regards
Akhila

Forwarded message
From: HEART FAILURE ASSOCIATION <hfaioffice@gmail.com>

Date: Tue, Sep 12, 2023 at 5:00 PM

Subject: Release of grant amount- for the third six months

To: akhila satyamurthy <asmeenaakhila@gmail.com>

Cc: Dr. Harikrishnan. S <drharikrishnan@outlook.com>, Abraham Oomman
<drabrahamoomman(@gmail.com>, Hilda Solomon <solomonhilda@yahoo.com>,
<heartfailureai2023 @gmail.com>, Meera Ahuja <Meera. Ahuja@maxhealthcare.com>

Dear Ms Akhila Satyamurthy,

Greetings from Heart Failure Association of India!

The third six months' grant amount (ie., Rs 93541) for your study with ID- HFAI/RG/2022/1, was released on 12th September
2023. The receipt of payment is attached herewith. A progress report should be submitted at the end of next 6 months (ie, on or

before 21st December), after which the funds for the last 6 months will be processed..

Regards,
HFAI Secretariat



